

# Bid Tabulation ITB 2024-305-WG MBCC LED Video Walls

	Advanced Document Solutions, Inc. <sup>4</sup>	Daktronics, Inc. <sup>7</sup>	i2 Visual, Inc. <sup>2</sup>	J Signs And Graphics <sup>6</sup>	LucentHD, LLC <sup>1</sup>	Quince Imaging, Inc. <sup>5</sup>	LaLa Brothers LLC d/b/a Techled <sup>3</sup>
Total Base Bid							
Total Base Bid	<del>\$ 995,657.08</del>	\$ 1,335,470.00	<del>\$ 636,376.00</del>	No Bid	\$ 545,825.00	<del>\$ 1,333,474.68</del>	\$ 708,194.00
Indemnification of City	<del>\$ 25.00</del>	\$ 25.00	<del>\$ 25.00</del>	No Bid	\$ 25.00	<del>\$ 25.00</del>	\$ 25.00
Permit Allowance	<del>\$ 20,000.00</del>	\$ 20,000.00	<del>\$ 20,000.00</del>	No Bid	\$ 20,000.00	<del>\$ 20,000.00</del>	\$ 20,000.00
<b>Grand Total</b>	<del><b>\$ 1,015,682.08</b></del>	<b>\$ 1,355,495.00</b>	<del><b>\$ 656,401.00</b></del>	No Bid	<del><b>\$ 565,850.00</b></del>	<del><b>\$ 1,353,499.68</b></del>	<del><b>\$ 728,219.00</b></del>

1 Deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a completed bid submittal questionnaire.

2 Deemed non-responsive for failure to meet the minimum requirement.

3 Deemed non-responsive for failure to meet the minimum requirement.

4 Deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a bid bond.

5 Deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a bid bond.

6 Deemed non-responsive for failure to submit a bid bond.

7 Recommended for award.