2025-060-DF Rental of Pumps and Related Equipment

Tabulation
Group 1 - Pump Rental
HE Equipment Services Mersino Dewatering Synergy Equipment United Rentals
HourlyRate  Daily Rate DaiyRate  yooryRate  WEKVRAte i Rate HowlyRate  DailyRate DalyRate  \oouyrate  WEKRAte i Rate HowlyRate  DalyRate DaiyRate — \yoonyrate WK RAte i Rate HowlyRate  DalyRate DaiyRate — yooyrate  WEKVRAte i Rate
ttom (Emergency) (Emergency) (Emergency) (Emergency) (Emergency) (Emergency) (Emergency) (Emergency)
1|4 No Bid S 190.00 | NoBid S 380.00 | NoBid S 115000 S 22000|S 2000 (§ 44000 ]S 66200 |5 132000 |S 196700 No Bid S 17700 |S 222005 5000 ]S 73800 |5  1.785.00 S 3300|S 26000 § 79400 ]S 78200 [ 158600 |5 156000
24" High Head No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 271.00 | § 271.00 | § 542.00 | § 811.00 [§  1,626.00 [ § 243500 No Bid $ 218.00 | § 273.00 | § 72800 [ § 91000 [§  2,205.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3[5 No Bid S 30000 | NoBid S 600.00 | NoBid S 180000 S 25000 |§ 26000 |5 580005 75000 |5 174000 |§ 250000 No Bid S 200005 300005 79700 |5 99800 |5 241600 S 38005 306005 66500 |5 991005 172800 |5 175000
4|6 High Head No Bid $ 700.00 | No Bid $  1,400.00 | No Bid $  4.200.00 $ 372.00 | § 372.00 | § 660.00 [§  1,117.00 [§  1,980.00 [ §  3,352.00 No Bid $ 311.00 | § 389.00 |§  1,039.00 | §  1,299.00 | §  3,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5[5 No Bid S 45300 | NoBid S 906.00 | NoBid 5 272000 S 391005 301005 781005 117300 |5 234500 |5 351800 No Bid S 26000 |§ 350005 93005 1170005 283500 S 61005 485005 117900 |5 145600 |5 267800 |5 310000
6|8 High Head No Bid $  1,250.00 | NoBid $  2500.00 | NoBid $  7,500.00 $ 502.00 | § 50200 | § 100400 |§ 150600 | §  3,013.00 | §  4,520.00 No Bid $ 364.00 | § 45500 [§ 121200 [§ 151500 [ § 367500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7[10” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid S 41500 |5 520005 13800 |5 173200 |5 420000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
810" High Head No Bid $  1,083.00 | No Bid $  2,167.00 | No Bid $  6,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 447.00 | § 556.00 | § 149000 | §  1,863.00 | § 451500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
o[z No Bid S 1.200.00 | NoBid S 240000 | NoBid S 720000 S 768005 768005  15%00 |5 230700 |5 46400 |5 692000 No Bid S 51900 |§ 64000 |5 173200 |5 216500 |5 525000 S 14000 S 1,12300 |5 224400 |5 224700 |5 448700 |5 450000
10| 12" High Head No Bid $  1,750.00 | No Bid $  3,500.00 | NoBid $ 10,500.00 $ 921.00 [ § 92100 [§  1,84200 [§ 276400 [§ 552800 [ § 830000 No Bid $ 572.00 | § 71500 [§  1,905.00 [§ 238200 [§  5775.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group 2 - Rental of Related Items
HE Equipment Rentals Mersino Dewatering Synergy Equipment United Rentals
‘GROUP 2A - Suction Hose
11 4710’ Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 15.00 [ § 15.00 [ § 29.00 | § 44.00 | § 88.00 | § 132.00 No Bid $ 7.00($ 7.00([$ 2200 | § 2200 | § 66.00 $ 300§ 2500 | § 44.00 | § 75.00 | § 79.00 | § 140.00
12| 20 Section No Bid S 1500 |NoBid S 3000 NoBid s 9000 S 2100|S 21005 4200]5 62005 125005 18700 No Bid 5 800§ 8005 2000[5 2400|5740 5 4005 2000|5 52005 _ 7800|S 105005 15000
13 |6710" Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 17.00 [ § 17.00 [ § 34.00 (§ 5000 § 101.00 | § 151.00 No Bid $ 1100 § 11.00 [ § 34.00 (§ 34.00 (§ 101.00 $ 5.00($ 4200 | § 5000 § 110.00 | § 102.00 | § 150.00
14 |6 20 Section NoBid S 2000 |NoBid S 4000 |NoBid s 1500 S 2300|S  2300]5 _ 4500|5 _ 6600|5  1300|S 20300 No Bid S 700§ 100|s _ 5300|S _ 5300|5 _ 160.00 5 6005 4500|5  6600|5 116005 132005 16000
15 |8710" Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2000 | § 2000 | § 41.00 | § 61.00 | § 122.00 | § 183.00 No Bid $ 13.00 [ § 13.00 [ § 40.00 | § 40.00 | § 120.00 $ 7.00($ 55.00 | § 85.00 | § 120.00 | § 175.00 | § 275.00
16 |5 20 Section NoBid S 3000 |NoBid S 60.00 NoBid 5 16000 S 28005  2800]5 _ 5700|5 _ 8500|5 170005 25500 No Bid S 26005 26005 7500]S _ 7500|5 22000 5 7005 600[5 _ 5700|5 128005 175005 28000
17 10" 10° Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 38.00 ($ 38.00 § 109.00 | § 109.00 | § 300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 [10° 20 Section No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 78005  7800|S 24000 ]S 24000 |5 52500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 12" 10’ Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 4200 | § 4200 | § 84.00 | § 126.00 | § 25200 [ § 378.00 No Bid $ 40.00 | § 40.00 | § 119.00 | § 119.00 | § 356.00 $ 15.00 [ § 100.00 | § 24500 [ § 300.00 | § 405.00 [ § 605.00
20 12" 20" Section No Bid $ 60.00 |No Bid $ 120.00 |No Bid $ 360.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 80.00 | § 80.00 | § 240.00 | § 24000 [ 600.00 $ 16.00 [ § 125.00 | § 321.00 | § 425.00 [ § 605.00 | § 625.00
GROUP 28 - Suction End Prolection Screen (Strainer)
27 [¢ NoBid S 1500 [NoBid S 3000 [NoBid s 9000 5 700§ 700[5__ 1400]5 _ 2100]5 _ 41.00]s 6200 No Bid 5 400§ 400[5__ 1200]5__ 1200]5 300 5 0[S 9005 1500]5 _ 2000]5 30005 .00
2 |6 No Bid $ 15.00 [No Bid $ 30.00 [No Bid $ 90.00 $ 9.00 | § 9.00 | § 18.00 [ § 27.00 | § 55.00 [ § 82.00 No Bid $ 500§ 500 | § 17.00 [ § 17.00 [ § 50.00 $ 200($ 1200 [ § 2000 | § 2400 | § 40.00 | § 35.00
I No Bid S 1500 |NoBid S 3000 [NoBid s 9000 S 1100|S 11005 2300|S _ 3400|5 _ 68.00|S 10300 No Bid 5 700 [ 5 700[5__ 2000[5 _ 2000|5 6000 5 3005 2000[5 _ 3000|5  300|s _ 5600(5 650
%[0 NoBid S 1500 [NoBW S 3000 [NoBid 5 om0 No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid B 800§ 8005 _ 2500[5 2500|5750 No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid
% |12 No Bid S 1500 [NoBid S 3000 [NoBid s 9000 S 1700|S  700]S _ 3400]S _ 5100|5 _ 103.00S 15400 NoBid 5 900 [ 5 900[5 _ 2800]5 __ 2800|5 8500 5 4005 3000[5 50005 60005 10000]S 20500
‘GROUP 2C - T
2% |4 No Bid $ 50.00 | No Bid $ 100.00 |No Bid $ 250.00 $ 5.00($ 500 | § 1000 [ § 15.00 [ § 30.00 [§ 45.00 No Bid $ 13.00 [ § 13.00 [ § 2600 | § 2600 | § 79.00 $ 500 ($ 4300 | § 70.00 | § 86.00 | § 138.00 | § 167.00
7| No Bid S 5000 [NoBid S 10000 [NoBid s o500 5 600§ 6005 12005 2000|3005 6000 No Bid S 1800|S  1800]S  3500]S  3500|5 10600 s 6005 4600[5  7300|5  8000|s 150005 2500
28 |8 No Bid $ 50.00 | No Bid $ 100.00 |No Bid $ 300.00 $ 8.00($ 8.00($ 16.00 [ § 2500 | § 48.00 | § 75.00 No Bid $ 24.00 | § 2400 | § 49.00 | § 49.00 | § 146.00 $ 6.00[$ 47.00 | § 9200 [ § 93.00 [§ 184.00 | § 280.00
2% [0 No Bid S 5000 [NoBid S 10000 [NoBid s 3500 NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid S 200|§ 27005 5400|S 5400|5620 NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid
S No Bid S 5000 [NoBid S 10000 [NoBid 5 35000 S 000§ 10005 2000]5 __ 3000|5 _ 60.00|s %000 No Bid S 2800|5  2800]5 _ 5B00]S 5600|5750 5 700[S 5700|9005 115005 193005 34500
‘GROUP 2D - Polypropylene Discharge Hose (up to 150 psi)
31 47 10" Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 20.00 | § 2000 | § 40.00 | § 61.00 | § 121.00 | § 182.00 No Bid $ 400 [$ 400 [$ 13.00 [§ 13.00 [ § 40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 |4 20 Secton No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 3000|§ 39005 7900|S  11800|5 23005 35400 No Bid B 7008 700[s _ 000[s _ 2000[s 6000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid
33 [6710" Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2500 | § 2500 | § 5000 [ § 76.00 | § 151.00 | § 227.00 No Bid $ 500 | § 500 | § 17.00 [ § 17.00 [ § 50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 20 Secton No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 6700|S 67005 135005 20300 |5 405005 60800 No Bid s 900 [ 5 9005 2600[5 2600|5800 No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid
35 [8710" Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3100 [§ 31.00 [§ 63.00 | § 94.00 [ § 188.00 | § 282,00 No Bid $ 7.00($ 7.00([$ 2000 | § 2000 | § 60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3|8 20 Secton No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 7600|S  7600]S 151005 22000 |5 454005 68100 No Bid S 100§ 100]s  3300]Ss  3300[5 10000 No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid
37 10" 10’ Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 800§ 8.00($ 2300 | § 2300 | § 70.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
38 |10°20 Secton No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid S 1300|s  1300]s  4000]s  4000[s 12000 No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid
39 12" 10’ Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 47.00 | § 47.00 | § 95.00 [ § 142.00 | § 284.00 [ § 533.00 No Bid $ 1100 [§ 1100 [ § 33.00 [$ 33.00 [$ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
40 12" 20’ Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 97.00 [ § 97.00 [ § 193.00 | § 29000 [ § 581.00 [ §  1,089.00 No Bid $ 17.00 [ § 17.00 [ § 53.00 [ § 53.00 [ § 160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GROUP 2E - Layllat Hose
41 4" 50’ Section No Bid $ 15.00 |No Bid $ 30.00 [No Bid $ 90.00 $ 15.00 [ § 15.00 [ § 29.00 | § 44.00 | § 88.00 | § 132.00 No Bid $ 15.00 [ § 15.00 [ § 4500 | § 4500 | § 135.00 $ 400 [$ 3500 [$ 40.00 | § 55.00 [ § 100.00 | § 150.00
42__|4 100 Section No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid S 2000|5 20005 8900|5  8900|5 27000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid
43 |6°50' Section No Bid $ 20.00 |No Bid $ 40.00 | No Bid $ 125.00 $ 17.00 [ § 17.00 [ § 34.00 [ § 5000 [ § 101.00 | § 151.00 No Bid $ 15.00 [ § 15.00 [ § 4500 | § 4500 | § 135.00 $ 5.00($ 38.00($ 60.00 | § 60.00 | § 12000 | § 180.00
4|6 100 Section No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid S s500|s  3500(s__ 10600|5 106005 52000 No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid
45 850" Section No Bid $ 30.00 |No Bid $ 60.00 | No Bid $ 180.00 $ 19.00 [§ 19.00 [ § 38.00 [ § 57.00 [§ 113.00 | § 170.00 No Bid $ 2200 | § 2200 | § 66.00 | § 66.00 | § 200.00 $ 6.00[$ 45.00 | § 75.00 | § 90.00 [ § 150.00 | § 280.00
4|8 100 Section No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid S 400s  4400(s__ 1200|5  15200|s 40000 NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid
47_[10° 50 Secton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 2700|5 27005 8300|S 8300 |5 25000 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid
48__[10° 100 Secton No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid S 54005 S400(S 164005 164005 500.00 NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid
49 12" 50' Section No Bid $ 70.00 |No Bid $ 140.00 | No Bid $ 420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 33.00 | § 33.00 | § 99.00 | § 99.00 | § 300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 12”100 Section No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid S 65005 6500 198005 198005 600.00 NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid




HE Equipment Rentals Mersino Dewatering Synergy Equipment United Rentals

Descriptio ourly R Daily R Dal ekly R o onthly R ourly R Daily R Da ekly R o onthly R ourly R Daily R Dal ekly R o onthly R ourly R Daily R D o o
‘GROUP 2F - Bauer-Style Hard Pipe with Locking Connections
51 4" 10" Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3.00 | § 3.00 | § 6.00 [$ 9.00 [ $ 17.00 | § 26.00 No Bid $ 6.00 [§ 6.00 [§ 18.00 | § 18.00 | § 52.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
52 4720 Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 5.00 | § 5.00 | § 1000 | § 14.00 | § 29.00 [ § 43.00 No Bid $ 9.00([$ 9.00[$ 26.00 [§ 26.00 § 78.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
53 6" 10" Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 5.00 | § 5.00 | § 1000 | § 14.00 | § 29.00 | § 43.00 No Bid $ 7.00 | § 7.00 | § 2200 | § 22.00 | § 65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 6720 Seckion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 800 (s 800]s  1500|s  200[s  4600]s 6800 No Bid $  1100[s 1005  s400[s  s400[s 10400 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 8" 10" Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 800 ($ 800 ($ 15.00 | § 23.00 | § 46.00 | § 68.00 No Bid $ 9.00[$ 9.00[$ 26.00 | § 26.00 | § 78.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
56 |6720 Seckion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $  1100[s  100fs  2300[s  s400[s  es00s 10300 No Bid S 400(s 14005  4300[s  4300[s 13000 s 500[s  4000[s 60005  s000[s 12000]5  160.00
57 10" 10’ Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1000 [ § 10.00 | § 30.00 | § 30.00 | § 91.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 |10"20 Seclion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid $  1700[s  1700[s  s200[s  s200]s 15600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
59 12" 10’ Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 11.00 | § 11.00 | § 23.00 | § 3400 | 66.00 | § 103.00 No Bid $ 14.00 | § 14.00 | § 43.00 | § 43.00 | § 130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60 12" 20’ Section No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 23.00 | § 23.00 | § 70.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 208.00 $ 10.00 | § 80.00 | § 120.00 | § 190.00 | § 300.00 | § 400.00
GROUP 26 - 45 Degree Bend/Elbow
o[ No Bid s 1000 [NoBid S 2000 [NoBid s 6000 $ 700 [ 700[5  1400[5  2100]s  41.00[s 6200 No Bid $ 600 [ 600[s  1200[s  1200]s 3600 $ 100]s 600[s  1200[s  1400[s  2500]s 5500
62 6 No Bid $ 10.00 |No Bid $ 20.00 |No Bid $ 60.00 $ 800§ 800§ 15.00 | § 23.00 | § 46.00 | § 68.00 No Bid $ 800§ 800§ 17.00 | § 17.00 | § 50.00 $ 100 [ § 7.00 | § 13.00 | § 15.00 | § 26.00 | § 62.00
EICH No Bid s 1000 NoBid S 2000 NoBid s 6000 $ 1100  100[s 23005  3400[s  es00|s 10300 NoBid s 1200]s 12005  2500]s 25005 7500 $ 100 900]s  o0s  1e00[s  2roo[s 7500
64 10" No Bid $ 10.00 |No Bid $ 20.00 | No Bid $ 60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 16.00 | § 16.00 | § 33.00 [ § 33.00 | § 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 12" No Bid $ 10.00 |No Bid $ 20.00 |No Bid $ 60.00 $ 17.00 [ $ 17.00 | § 34.00 | § 51.00 | § 103.00 | § 154.00 No Bid $ 2000 | § 2000 | § 41.00 | § 41.00 | § 125.00 $ 3.00 [ $ 18.00 | § 25.00 | § 35.00 | $ 65.00 | § 95.00
GROUP 2H - 90 Degree Bend/Elbow,
%[ No Bid s 1000 [NoBid S 2000 [NoBid S 6000 $ 700[s 700[5  1400[5  2100]s  41.00[s 6200 No Bid $ 600 [ 600[s  1200[s  1200]s 3600 $ 100 s 600[s  1000[s 12005  2000]s 3600
67 6 No Bid $ 10.00 |No Bid $ 20.00 |No Bid $ 60.00 $ 800 ($ 800 ([$ 15.00 | § 23.00 | § 46.00 | § 68.00 No Bid $ 800 ($ 800 ([$ 17.00 | § 17.00 | § 50.00 $ 200 ($ 18.00 | § 25.00 | § 31.00 [ § 5000 | § 45.00
%[ NoBid s 1000 NoBid S 2000 NoBid s 6000 § 1100  100[s  2800[s  3400[s 68005 10300 NoBid s 1200]s 12005  2500]s 25005 7500 s 300]s  2000[s w5005  3500[s  s500]s 5000
69 10" No Bid $ 10.00 |No Bid $ 20.00 | No Bid $ 60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 16.00 | § 16.00 | § 33.00 [ § 33.00 | § 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
70 12" No Bid $ 10.00 |No Bid $ 20.00 |No Bid $ 60.00 $ 17.00 [ $ 17.00 | § 34.00 | § 51.00 | § 103.00 | § 154.00 No Bid $ 2000 | § 2000 | § 41.00 | § 41.00 | § 125.00 $ 6.00 [ $ 45.00 | § 60.00 | § 90.00 | § 121.00 | § 270.00
GROUP 21 - Bauer-siyle Wye Connection
G No Bid S 2000 [NoBid S 4000 [NoBid S 8000 s 1000]s  1000[s  2100]s  3100]s  600[s 9300 No Bid S 1200[s 12005  2500]s 25005 7500 s 100 s 6005  1000[s  1200[s  2000]s 3600
72 6 No Bid $ 20.00 |No Bid $ 40.00 |No Bid $ 80.00 $ 15.00 [ 15.00 | § 3000 | § 44.00 | § 89.00 | § 133.00 No Bid $ 15.00 | § 15.00 | § 30.00 [ § 3000 | § 90.00 $ 200 ($ 18.00 | § 25.00 | § 31.00 [ 5000 | § 45.00
[EC No Bid S 2000 NoBid S 4000 NoBid s 10000 § 1700  100fs  s400[s  st00[s  103.00[s 15400 NoBid S 2000 20005  4000]s 40005 12500 s 300]s  2000[s w5005  500[s  s500]s 5000
74 10 No Bid $ 20.00 |No Bid $ 40.00 | No Bid $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 29.00 | § 20.00 | § 88.00 | § 88.00 | § 265.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
75 12" No Bid $ 20.00 |No Bid $ 40.00 |No Bid $ 150.00 $ 26.00 | § 26.00 | § 5200 | § 78.00 | § 157.00 | § 235.00 No Bid $ 29.00 | § 29.00 | § 88.00 | § 88.00 | § 265.00 $ 7.00 [ $ 45.00 | § 60.00 | § 90.00 | § 121.00 | § 270.00
'GROUP 2J - Float Switch Level Sensor

¢ e | S P P R P P P P RO P P P

Sensor No Bid s 4000 |NoBid S 8000 |NoBid $ 15000 s 10 14005  2800(S  4300|5  8500[S 12800 NoBid s 12005 1200 3005 36.00 108.00 $ 200 s 1900|S  3000|S  3800|S 6000 [S 18500

‘GROUP 2K - Road/Hose Ramps
77 [RoadHose Ramps__| [No Bid [s 11000 [NoBid [s 22500 [NoBid s es000] [s 12500]s  12500]s  25000]5  37600[5 752005 112800 | [No Bid [ 7500]s  7500]s  22500]s  22500]5 67500 [NoBid [NoBid [NoBid [NoBid [NoBid [NoBid
GROUP 2L - 6" x 4” Connection Reducing Adapter
el | | [P PR PR P | S P PP PR PR R PR PP PR PR
Reducing Adapter No Bid $ 20.00 |No Bid $ 40.00 |No Bid $ 120.00 $ 9.00 9.00 [$ 19.00 | § 28.00 | § 57.00 [ § 86.00 No Bid $ 400 [$ 4.00 9.00 [$ 9.00 28.00 $ 1.00 [§ 7.00 (8 10.00 | § 15.00 | § 20.00 | § 45.00
Group 3 - Emergency Technical Services
HE Equipment Rentals. Mersino Dewatering Synergy Equipment United Rentals

Item Description
79 |Emergency Labor Rate Hourly 5 150,00 Hourly $ 140,00 Houty $ 185.00 Houry No Bid




