ITB 2025-009-MP TEMPORARY STAFFING SERVICES

Group 1 Group2 Group 3 Group4 Group5
Administrative Office Engineering Construction / Project Managers Industrial Information Technology
Bidder 'MARKUP Bidder 'MARKUP Bidder 'MARKUP Bidder 'MARKUP Bidder 'MARKUP
Talantage, LLC * 1.26%) Talantage, LLC* 1.26% Talantage, LLC* 1.27%| Talantage, LLC* 1.27%| Talantage, LLC* 1.26%
Let's Work USA Inc* 1.42% | Let's Work USA Inc* 1.48% | Let's Work USA Inc* 1.48% | Let's Work USA Inc* 1.46% | Let's Work USA Inc* 1.42%
Darwin Recruitment Inc ' 10.00%| |Darwin Recruitment Inc ' 10.00%| | Darwin Recruitment Inc ' 10.00%| | Darwin Recruitment Inc ' 10.00%| | Darwin Recruitment Inc * 10.00%
*TRG, INC 15.00%| KevStaff, inc* 17.00%| 4BB Corp* 17.98%| *TRG, INC? 15.00%| KevStaff, inc.” 17.00%
KeyStaff, inc* 16.00%| [a88 corp 198%| [TRG, INC? 18.00%| (488 corp* 17.98%| [ 22nd Century Technolodies. Inc*. 17.25%
22nd Century Technologies, Inc.” wasx| [TRe, INC? 18.00%| [Adil Business Svstems.inc.” 18.63%| [Adil Business Svstems.inc.” 1863%| (488 Coro® 17.98%
488 Corp® 17.98%| | Trvfacta, Inc.s 18.40%| | 22nd Century Technoloies. Inc.” 19.02%| [ 22nd Century Technolodies. Inc*. 19.0%| [Tc1 Grous 18.00%
TCI Group 18.00%| [Adil Business Systemsnc. 18.63%| A& Associates, Inc. 19.05%| A& Associates, Inc. 1915%| [ TR, I 18.00%
Tryfacta, Inc. 18.40%| [ 22nd Century Technologies, Inc. 19.00| | Trytacta, Inc. 19.45%| [ Trytacta, Inc. 19.45%| [ Trlogy Intemational Inc. 18.00%
P.LE. Management, L.L.C. 18.49%| A& Assaciates, Inc. 19.15%| [ACS Consultancy Services Inc. 2000%| [ACS Consultancy Services Inc. 2000%| [ Tytacta, Inc. 18.40%
Adil Business Systems,Inc. 1863%| [ACS Consultancy Services Inc. 2000%| [Tct Group 2000%| [Tc1 Group 2000%| [ Adil Business Systems,Inc. 18.6%
A& Assaclates, Inc, 19.15%| | P.LE. Management, LL.C. 2000%| | Corporate Solutions General Inc. 21.00%| | Corporate Solutions General Inc. 2100w| |A& Associates, Inc, 19.15%)
ATHENA Consulting LLC 19.50%| |TCI Group 2000%| |Advancet stafing 21.50% |Abacus Corporation 23.00%| | Precision Staffing Inc dba AP Recruters & Associates 20.00%
ACS Consultancy Services Inc. 20.00%| | Corporate Solutions General Inc. 21.00%| [Abacus Corporation 23.00%| [PACKPLUS INC 20.00%| | P.LE. Management, L.L.C. 2000%
Precision Staffing Inc dba AP Recruiters & Associates 20.00% Advance1 Staffing 21.50% PACKPLUS INC 24.00% Advance1 Staffing 24.50% Comorate Solutions General Inc. 21.00%|
Corporate Solutions General Inc. 20.00% | Abacus Corporation 23.00% Changing Technologies. Inc. 25.00% Changing Technologies. Inc. 25.00% SystemDomain Inc 21.00%|
Abacus Corporation 21.00% Integrative Staffing Group. LLC, 23.40% P.LE. Management, L.L.C. 25.00% P.|.E. Management. L.L.C, 25.00%) Advance1 Staffing 21.50%|
Netsynk Inc. 21.00%|  [Intemational Solution Sources Inc 2351%| | Technostaif LLC dba HonorVet Technologies 25.005%| | Technostaif LLC dba HonorVet Technologies 25.00%| [Tunabear Inc 2200
SystemDomain Inc 2100%| [PackeLUS INC 26.00%| | Intecraive Stafina Grouo. LLC. 26.40%| [ Netsvnk Inc. 26.00%| [Crvstal Data LLC 2299%
Advance1 Staffing 21.50% | |Precision Staffing Inc dba AP Recruters & Assoclates 25.00%| | Adroix Cop 27.00%| | Intearative Stafina Groun. LLC. 26.40%| |Abacus Corporation 23.00%
PROJAS TECHNOLOGIES LLC 22.00% |Changing Technologies, Inc. 25.00%| | Netsynk Inc. 27.00% | Adroix C 27.00%| | Integrative Staffing Group, LLC. 23.40%
Crystal Data LLC 22.99% DS Technologies 25.00%) Vastika Inc. 28.00%) Intellibee Inc 28.00% International Solution Sources Inc 23.51%
Integrative Staffing Group, LLC. 23.40%| [ Netsynk Inc. 25.00%|[ccR creative Consuting Recruitment Firm. nc. 30.00%| [ Vastica Inc, 28.00%| [ACS Consultancy Services Inc. 20.00%
Interational Solution Sources Inc 23.515%)| [ Technostaif LLC dba HonorVet Technologies 25.00%| [ Intelivee Inc 30.005%| ~[cCR Creative Consulting Recruitment Firm. Inc. s000%| [PACKPLUS INC 20.00%
PACKPLUS INC 22.00%| | Adroix Corp 27.00%| |Personnel Solutions Plus, LLG 30.00%| | OCH SERVICES LLC DBA ON CUE HIRE 30.00%| | Changing Technologies, Inc. 25.00%
HighCloud Solutions, Inc 24.09% ALOIS LLC 27.00%| ALOISLLC 34.00% Personnel Solutions Plus. LLC 30.00%| iBrain Technologies Inc 25.00%|
Changing Technologes, Inc. 25.00%| | Vastika Inc. 28.00%| | OCH SERVICES LLG DBA ON CUE HIRE 34.00%| [ WoliCreek Consuiting Inc 31.00%| [PROJAS TECHNOLOGIES LLC 25.00%
Shawn Brown 25.00%| [ WoliCreek Consuiting Inc 28.00%| [ Affinity Medical Staffina. LLC 3475%| [Purle Eadle Technoloay Com 33.00%|[SA Technolodies Inc 25.00%
Sonus Software Solutions Inc., 25.00%|*[ccR creative Consuting Recruitment Firm. Inc. 30.00%| [ Coolsoft. LLC. 3s.00 [ty Medical Stafing, LLC 34.75%| | Technostaff LLC dba HonorVet Technologies 25.00%
Sunshine Enterprise USA LLC 25.00%| - [Intelibee Inc 30.00%| [Rana Technolodies Inc 35.00%| [ Coolsoft LLC. 3s.00%| [TECHSBCN 2571%
Technostaff LLC dba HonorVet Technologies 25.00%|  [Personnel Solutions Pus. LLC 30.00%| [ eNcloud Senvices LLC 36.00%| ~[Shawn Brown 35.00%| | Adroix Coro 27.00%
[ TECHSBCN 25.00% Purple Eagle Technology Corp 30.00%) Industrial Staffing Services Inc. DBA Equiliem 38.00%) Rang Technologies Inc 35.00% ALOIS LLC 27.00%|
Adroix Corp 27.00%| |UNIQUE System Skills LLC 30.00%| |Purple Eagle Technology Comp 38.00%| [Sunshine Enterprise Usa LLC. 35.00%| |Services on-site 27.00%
ALOISLLC 27.00% Hanker Systems Inc, 32.00%) SolveNow, Inc. 38.00%) eNcloud Services LLC 36.00% Vastika Inc, 28.00%|
Personnel Solutions Plus, LLC 27.00%| | OCH SERVICES LLC DBA ON CUE HIRE 3220%| | Tekwissen LLC 38.00% | Intearated Staffina Corporation 37.00%| |WoltCreek Consuitina Inc 28.00%
AFL INTERNATIONAL CONSULTING STAFF AND
Services On-Site 27.00% Coolsoft, LLC. 33.00%) Optimuss Inc. 39.00%) Industrial Staffing Services Inc, DBA Equiliem 38.00%| 'SERVICES INC 30.00%
OCH SERVICES LLC DBA ON CUE HIRE 27.805| [ SelveNow: Inc. 33.00%| [Diskrier, Inc. 4000 | SolveNow: Ine- 38.00%| ~[ccR Creative Consuling Recruitment Firm, inc. 30.00%
Intellbee Inc: 28.00%|  [optimuss Inc. 34.00%| [ nsiaht Global, LLC 40.00%| | Optimuss Inc. 39.00%| [ Coolsoft LLC. 30.00%
Vastika Inc. 28.00% Affinitv Medical Staffina. LLC 34.75%) Xpand Staffina. LLC 40.00% | ALOIS LLC 40.00%| Hanker Svstems Inc. 30.00%|
AppleOne, Inc. dba AppleOne Employment
WoliCreek Consulting Inc 28.00%|  [Buzzcian, LLc 35.00%| [Services 42.00%| [Disiiter, Inc. 40.00%| | NetsynkInc. 30.00%
HCT Cerified Public Accountanis and Consulants,
R creative Consulting Recruitment Firm, Inc. 30.00%| |Encode Inc 3s00u [Lic 22.00%| |Insignt Global, LLC 20.00m [Personnel Solutions Plus, LLG 30.00%
Coolsot, LLC. 30.00%| [ Health Advocates Network, Inc. DBA Staff Today 35.00%| [chiraz Kell 42.00%| | Tekwissen LLC 40.00%|  [Purple Eaale Technoloav Corn 30.00%
AppleOne, Inc. dba AppleOne Employment
Purple Eagle Technology Corp 30.00%|  [Rang Technologies Inc 35.00%| [ HighCloud Solutions, Inc: e |Services 42.00%|  [Sonus Software Solutions Inc., 30.00%
HCT Certified Public Accountants and Consultants,
UNIQUE System Skills LLC 30.00% | Sunshine Enterprise USA LLC 35.00% Healthcare Staffing Professionals dba HSP, Inc. 45.00%| 42.00%| Sunshine Enterprise USA LLC 30.00%
Integrated Staffing Corporation 31.00% eNcloud Services LLC 36.00% Sunshine Enterprise USA LLC 45.00% Chiraz Kelly 42.00%| UNIQUE System Skills LLC 30.00%
Health Advocates Network, Inc. DBA Staff Today 31.85%|  [Interated Stafing Comoration 37.00%| [RADaov. Inc. 46.00%| [Beattvs Senvices. Inc. 17| |ImscientLLc 33.00%
Hanker Systems Inc. 3200%| |Vidhwan Inc. DBA E-Solutions 38.00%| | Adelphi Staffing, LLC 50.00%| |Health Advocates Network, Inc. DBA Staff Today as.00%| | SoveNow, Inc. 33.00%
Rose International, Inc. 34.00%| | Inustrial Staffing Services Inc. DBA Equiliem 38.00%( |Shawn Brown s0.00%| [Healtncare Staffing Professionals doa HSP, Inc. 45.00%|  [DatamanusA. LLC 30.00%
SoftSages LLC 34.00%| | SearchPros Staffing, LLC 38.00%| [ Precision Staffing Inc dba AP Recruiters & Associates 55.00%| | Sparks Personnel Services, Inc. 25.00% |Optimuss Inc. 34.00%
Affinity Medical Staffing. LLC 34.75%  TekWissen LLC 38.00% INSPYR Solutions, LLC 55.00% Xpand Staffing, LLC 45.00% Rose |nternational. Inc. 34.00%
BuzzClan, LLC 3s.00%| [TECHARMY.LLC 38.89% |Health Advocates Network, Inc. DBA Staff Today 75.00%| [RADaov. Inc. a.005| | Afinity Medical Stafing, LLC 3075%
Bonnie Chao 35.00%| - [iskrier, Inc. 4000%| | AFLINTERNATIONAL CONSULTING STAFFAN  NoBin| |Adelphi Staffing, LLC 50.00%|  [Bayinfotecn LLC 35.00%
Encode Inc 35.00%|  [Shawn Brown 40.00%| [ATHENA Consuttina LLC Noain| |HianCloud Solutiens, Inc: 5082%|  [BuzzClan, LLC 35.00%
Healthcare Staffing Professionals dba HSP, Inc. 35.00% Healthcare Staffing Professionals dba HSP, Inc. 40.00%| Bavinfotech LLC NO BID Precision Staffing Inc dba AP Recruiters & Associates 55.00% Encode Inc 35.00%
Infojini Inc. 35.00%| [Insight Global, LLC 40.00%| [Beattys Senvices, Inc. Nosin| |INSPYR Solutions, LG 55.00%| [ Healtncare Staffing Professionals doa HSP, Inc. 35.00%
Rang Technologies Inc 35.00%|  [RADgov, Inc. 4000%| [BRICKELL PERSONNEL CONSULTANTS, INC. Noain| | Vidhwan Inc. DBA E-Solutions oo finfojini Inc. 35.00%
| AppleOne, Inc, dba AppleOne Employment AFL INTERNATIONAL CONSULTING STAFF AND
DatamanUSA, LLC 36.00% Services 42.00%| Business Integra Technology Solutions Inc. NO BID 'SERVICES INC no bid Intellibee Inc. 35.00%)
eNcloud Services LLC 36.00% Chiraz Kelly 42.00%| BuzzClan, LLC NO BID ATHENA Consulting LLC no bid Rana Technoloaies Inc 35.00%
HCT Certified Public Accountants and Consultants, Zirlen Technologies, Inc.
Industrial Staffing Services Inc. DBA Equiliem 36.00% 45.00%| [Bonnie Chao noei| |BayinfotecnLLC nobid g 35.00%
Vidhwan Inc, DBA E-Solutions 38.00% | |Tellus Solutions Inc. 46.00%| |Crystal Data LLC No8iD| [BRICKELL PERSONNEL CONSULTANTS, INC. nobid| | eNcloud Sevices LLC 36.00%
SearchPros Staffing, LLC 38.00%| [Adelohi Staffina. LLC 50.00%| [Datamanusa. LLC No&in| | Business Inteara Technology Solutions Inc. nobid|  [Vidhwan Inc. DBA E-Solutions 36.00%
Beatty's Senvices, Inc. 38.21% MGT Impact Solutions, LLC 50.00% DS Technologies NO BID BuzzClan, LLC no bid Health Advocates Network, Inc. DBA Staff Today 36.00%
Diskriter, Inc. 40.00% Xpand Staffina, LLC 50.00% Eleaant Enterprise-Wide Solutions. Inc. NO BID Bonnie Chao no bid| Intearated Staffina Corporation 37.00%)
HCT Certfied Public Accountants and Consultants, Encode Inc: Elegant Enterprise-Wide Solutions, Inc.
LLc 40.00% | [HighCloud Solutions, Inc: 52.76% Nosip| [Crstal DataLLC o bid! 9 rprise- »ne 38.00%
Insight Global, LLC 40.00% INSPYR Solutions, LLC 55.00% Vidhwan Inc. DBA E-Solutions NO BID| DatamanUSA, LLC no bid Industrial Staffing Services Inc, DBA Equiliem 38.00%
SolveNow, Inc. AFL INTERNATIONAL CONSULTING STAFF AND DS Technologies
4000%| |SERVICES INC noai| |Expery, Inc. NOBID, nobid|  [RADaov. Inc. 38.00%
Sparks Personnel Services, Inc. 2000%| |ATHENA Consulting LLC Noin| [Hanker Systems Inc. Nogip| [Elegant Enterprise-Wide Solutions, Inc. nobid| [Red Sun Technoloay 38.00%
[ TekWissen LL¢ 40.00% Bavinfotech LLC NO BID iBrain Technoloaies Inc NO BID Encode Inc no bid| SearchPros Staffina. LLC 38.00%
TrOptus LLC 40.00% Beatty's Services, Inc. NO BID| Infoiini Inc. NO BID| Experfy, Inc. no bid SoftSaqes LLC 38.00%
Xpand Staffing, LLC 4000%| |BRICKELL PERSONNEL CONSULTANTS, INC. Noain| |intecrated Staffina Corporation NoBiD| |Hanker Svstems Inc. nobid|  [TekwissenLLC 38.00%
Optimuss Inc. 41.00% Business Integra Technology Solutions Inc. NO BID International Solution Sources Inc NO BID| iBrain Technologies Inc no bid 'OCH SERVICES LLC DBA ON CUE HIRE 38.75%|
AppleOne, Inc, dba AppleOne Employment
Services £200%|  [Bonnie Chao noao| [mscienTLic noeo| [infojini inc. nobig| |TECHARMY.LLC 38.88%
Business Integra Technology Solutions Inc. 42.00% Crvstal Data LLC NO BID| KevStaff, inc NO BID| International Solution Sources Inc no bid Diskriter. Inc. 40.00% |
Eleaant Enterprise-Wide Solutions. Inc. 42.00% DatamanUSA, LLC NO BID MGT Impact Solutions, LLC NO BID| IT-SCIENTLLC no bid Experfv, Inc. 40.00% |
RADgov, Inc. 42.00%| |Flegant Enterprise-Wide Solutions, Inc. nosin| [PRoJAs TECHNOLOGIES LLC Nosin| [Kevstaft, inc nobid| [insiant Global, LLC 40.00%
Chiraz Kelly 42.00%( |Experty. Inc. NoaiD| |Red Sun Technoloav No&iD| |MGT Impact Solutions. LLC nobid| | Trioptus LLC a0.00%
Tellus Solutions inc 46.00%( | iBrain Technoloaies Inc Noain| |Rose Intemational. Inc. Noein| |PROUAS TECHNOLOGIES LLC nobid|  [Chiraz Kelh a2.00%
AppleOne, Inc. dba AppleOne Employment
NGT Impact Solutions, LLC 50.00% | [Infojni nc. Noain| |sA Technologies Inc Noain| |Red Sun Technology nobid| [ Services as.00%
Adelphi Stafing, LLC ss.o0%| [m-scientLie Noain| | SearchPros Staffng, LLC Noain| |Rose Intemational, Inc, nobid|  [Shawn Brown a5.00%
BRICKELL PERSONNEL CONSULTANTS, INC. 55.00%| |PROJAS TECHNOLOGIES LLC Nogip |Services On-Site No8iD| |SA Technolodies Inc nobid|  [Sparks Personnel Services, Inc. 45.00%
INSPYR Solutions, LLC 55.00% Red Sun Technoloav NO BID SoftSages LLC NO BID SearchPros Staffina. LLC no bid| Tellus Solutions Inc 46.00%|
AFL INTERNATIONAL CONSULTING STAFF AND
SERVICES INC Noain| |Rose Intemational, Inc. No&iD| |Sonus Software Solutions Inc., Noain| |services On-site nobid| | Business Inteara Technoloay Solutions Inc. 48.00%
HCT Certified Public Accountants and Consultants,
Baylnfotech LLC No&ip| [sA Technologies Inc NoBiD| [Sparks Personnel Services, Inc. noain| | Softsages LLC nobid| [LLe 29.00%
DS Technologies NO BID Services On-Site NO BID SystemDomain Inc NO BID| Sonus Software Solutions Inc.. no bid Adelphi Staffina. LLC 50.00%
Experfy, Inc. NO BID SoftSages LLC NO BID| ' TECH ARMY, LLC NO BID| SystemDomain Inc no bid MGT Impact Solutions, LLC 50.00%
iBrain Technologies Inc Nosio| [sonus Software Solutions Inc., Nosip| [TECHSBCN Nosip| [TECHARMY.LLC nobid| |BRICKELL PERSONNEL CONSULTANTS, INC. 55.00%
IT-SCIENT LLC NOBID| |Sparks Personnel Services. Inc. NoaiD| |Tellus Solutions Inc noain| |rEcHsseN nobid | [INSPYR Solutions. LLC 55.00%
Red Sun Technology NoaiD| | SvstemDomain Inc No&iD| | Trioay Intematinat inc. NoaiD| |Tellus Sotutions Inc nobid| [HianCloud Selutions. Inc 57.005%
SA Technologies Inc noain| |TECHSBCN noain| | Trioptus LLC noaio| | Triloay International Inc, nobid|  [Xpand Staffna. LLC 70.00%
TECH ARMY. LLC Noaio| | Trlea Intemational Inc, NoaiD| |Tunabear inc noain| | Troptus LLC nobid | [ATHENA Consuitina LG nobid
Triogy Interationa Inc. Noain| | Trioptus LLC Noain| |UNIQUE Sustem Skills LLC No&iD| |Tunabear inc nobid|  [Beatts Services. Inc. nobid
Tunabear Inc NoBiD| |Tunabear inc Noain| |WoliCreek Consuting Inc: No&in| |UNIQUE Sustem Skills LLC nobid| [Bonnie Chao nobid
Ziden Inc NO BID Ziflen lies. Inc NOBID; Ziflen Inc NO BID] Zirlen Inc no bid DS no bid

* Recommended for award
|* Non-responsive
* Withdrew aplication



